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Freedom of Information Request 
 
Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request. 
 
Request / Response: 
 
Total cost of interpreting services in the last 2 years and the number of requests 
made? 
 
£13,758.09 for 977 sessions 
 
Total cost of translation services in the last 2 years and the number of requests 
made? 
 
£60 for 1 session 
 
Total cost of BSL interpreting in the last 2 years and the number of requests made 
 
£16,503.62 for 154 sessions  
 
I would also be grateful if you could provide us with information that includes: 
  
Hourly cost of face to face interpreting services 
 
The CCG commissions 3 providers of face to face interpreting services, with different 
pricing structures as follows: 
 
Provider 1:   
 
Registered Sign Language Interpreter: £104 (office hours) £110 (out of office hours) 
plus travel 
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Trainee Sign Language Interpreter TSLI: £99 (office hours) £105 (out of office hours) 
plus travel; 
 
Speech to text reporter: at cost plus £25 admin fee + travel £26 per half hour 
thereafter 
 
Provider 2:  
 
£99 per appointment 
 
Provider 3:   
 
£25 per hour 
 
Cost per minute of telephone interpreting services 
 
Language Line approx. 0.010p per minute 
 
Breakdown of the top 10 most popular languages 
 
1. Arabic  
2. Persian Farsi  
3. Kurdish Sarani  
4. Polish  
5. Albanian  
6. Cantonese  
7. Mandarin  
8. Italian 
9. French  
10. Lingala 
 
How many video interpreting sessions were made last year for all languages, 
including British Sign Language? 
 
None 
 
Can you please provide details of your current provider(s) (company name, date 
contract was awarded)? 
 
Language Line Solutions  
Action on Hearing Loss  
Deafness Resource Centre 
Global Accent Interpreting Services  
 
The CCG does not hold information on contract award date as the contracts are held 
by NHS England, with the CCG being responsible for payment of services used.  
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The contracts are held by NHS England who will hold information on dates the 
contracts were awarded. 
 
When are your current language service contracts with your incumbent(s) due to 
end? 
 
The CCG does not hold information on contract end date as the contracts are held 
by NHS England, with the CCG being responsible for payment of services used. 
 
Please can you provide the name, job title, email address and contact number for the 
person(s) responsible: 
 
1. For awarding any contracts relating to these services 

Tony Woods, Director of Strategy and Performance, 
Knowsley.CCGcommunications@knowsley.nhs.uk, 0151 244 4185 

 
2. For managing the day to day running of the services 

Ilse Newsome, Interim Head of Contracts, 
Knowsley.CCGcommunications@knowsley.nhs.uk, 0151 244 4185 
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